
TABULATION OF BIDS 

FOR 

LITTLE RIVER SEWER REHABILITATION-PHASE II 

COMMISSION OF PUBLIC WORKS 

CITY OF LAURENS, SOUTH CAROLINA 

 

 
BIDS RECEIVED UNTIL 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME, MARCH 26, 2026 

 
 

 

Bidder 

S.C. 
Contractor’s 
License No. 

Part I 
Base Bid 

Total 

Part II 
Bid Alternate 

One Total 
Grand Total 

     
Atlantic Pipe Services 
Sanford, FL 
 

127328 
 

$686,378.95 
 

$233,272.22 $919,651.17 

Bio-Nomic Services, Inc. 
Belmont, NC 
 

118749 
 

$640,191.00 
 

$192,236.00 $832,427.00 

BLD Services 
Kenner, LA 
 

115612 
 

$478,848.00 
 

$210,608.00 $689,456.00 

CaJenn Construction & 
Rehabilitation Services, Inc. 
Hoboken, GA 
 

112926 $443,864.40 $178,880.10 $622,744.50 

Champion Cleaning Specialists, Inc. 
Cincinatti, OH 
 

124629 
 

$213,074.50 
 

$184,046.68 $397,121.18 

Fifth Construction, LLC 
Greenville, SC 
 

124579 
  

NO BID 

GCU, LLC 
Theodore, AL 
 

121548 
  

NO BID 

Hinterland Group, Inc. 
Riviera Beach, FL 
 

126028 $528,333.60 $133,993.60 $662,327.20 

Inliner Solutions, LLC 
Tucker, GA 
 

107212 
  

NO BID 

Insituform Technologies LLC 
Chesterfield, MO 
 

117075 
  

NO BID 

McClam & Associates, Inc. 
Little Mountain, SC 
 

10203 
  

NO BID 

NGI Trenchless Pipe & Sewer 
Repair Inc. 
Canton, GA 
 

 

  

NO BID 
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Bidder 

S.C. 
Contractor’s 
License No. 

Part I 
Base Bid 

Total 

Part II 
Bid Alternate 

One Total 
Grand Total 

     
Nu-Pipe LLC 
St. Petersburg, FL 
 

   NO BID 

SAK Construction, LLC 
O’Fallon, MO 
 

114041   NO BID 

Vortex Services, LLC 
Houston, TX 
 

118010 $654,915.40 $340,052.00 $994,967.40 

 
 
 

    

 
Note: This is a preliminary bid tabulation.  The Contractor’s numbers have not been verified.  The Final Bid 
Tabulation will be posted at a later date.  


